
m-qio (,s-ro-rzzontqqtirq(g). - s{r{fl fi dfrerr4 fi 3r{-"d"{ r+a S'Eis (r)

* :r{s{ur fr Ts freTrrr 6r

Eaio zs-ot-zota ar riffit rEar<
fi-ffifi (rs-ro-3,/2ot8lsrm'zqiq (9),

srfuoru t {aEErr rorRrf, fu-qr ErdI tt

a-Ssrrq {q{d, ft-{is zs q++t zorr

a-qr {rqg{, kaizn zs a-*rft zorg

6r (ss)

afuqa-+
{Eqqrd ai

Efr€T6 il'rrqqr6{ d arr t aqT 3{raan{Tr,
(r. fr. MI, fuclq €fu4.

Naya Raipur, the 25th January 2018

NOTIFICATION
No. 0212018 - State Tax(Rate)

No. F-I0- 3i2018/CT/V (9). - In exercise ofthe powers confened by sub-section (1) of section I I of
the Chhattisgarh Coods and Services Tax Act,20l7 ('l of 2017), the State Goyemment, on being satisfied that it
is necessary in the public interest so to do, on the recommendations ofthe Council, hereby makes the following
further amendments in the notification No.l2l2017- state Tax (Rate), F- l 0-43l2017lcT^/(80) dated the
28hlurle,20l7 of Commercial Tax Department, Government of Chhattisgarh, published in the Gazette of
Chhattisgarh (Extraordinary), vide number 252, dated the 29hJune, 2017, namely :-

In the said notificalion, in lhe Table, -

(a) against serial number 3, in the entry in column (3), after the words "a Govemmental Authority" the
words " or a Govemment Entity" shall be inserted;

(b) after serial number 3 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be

inserted, namely: -

against serial number l6,in the entry in column (3), for the words "one year", the words "three years"
shall be substituted;

after serial number 19 ard the entries relating thereto, the following sedal number and entries shall be

inserted, namely : -

(c)

(l) Q) (3) (4) (5)

"3A Chapter
99

Composite supply of goods and services in whichthe value
of supply of goods constitutes not more than 25 per cent. of
the value of the said composite supply provided to the
Central Government, State Govemment or Union territory or
local authority or a Covemmental autlority or a Govemment
Entity by way of any activity in relation to any function
entrusted to a Panchayat under article 243G of the
Constitution or in relation to any function entrusted to a
Municipality under article 243w ofthe Constitution.

Nil Nil";

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)

*l9A Heading
9965

Services by ivay of transportation of
goods by an aircraft lrom customs station
of clearance in India to a place outside
India.

Nit Nothing contained in this serial
number shall apply after the
30thday of September, 201 8.

(d)



6l (s6) udsrr6 {qrd, Aqi6 25 qfio 2ol8

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)

l98 Heading
9965

Services by way of transportation of
goods by a vessel from customs station of
clearance in India to a place outside India.

Nil Nothing contained in this serial
numbershall apply after the
306day of September, 2018.";

(e) against serial number 22,in the enty in column (3), after item (b), the following item shall be inserted,
namely : -

"(c) motor vehicle for transport of students, faculty and staff, to a person providing services of
transportation of students, faculty and staff to an educational institution providing services by way of
pre-school education and education upto higher secondary school or equivalent.";

(0 after serial number 29 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely : -

(g) against serial number 36,in the enlry in column (3), in item (c), for the words "fifty thousa.nd', the
words "two lakhs" shall be substituted;

(h) after serial number 36 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be

inserted, namely : -

(i) after serial number 39 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely : -

(l) Q) (3) (4) (5)

'294 Heading
9971 or
Heading
9991

Services of life insurance provided or agreed to be provided
by the Naval Group Insurance Fund to the personnel of
Coast Guard under the Group Insurance Schemes of the
Central Government.

Nil Nil";

(l) (2) (3) (4) (s)

'36A Heading
9971 or
Heading
999t

Services by way of reinsurance ofthe insurance schemes
specified in serial number 35 or 36.

Nit Nil";

(l) (2) (3) (4) (5)

"39A. Heading
997 |

Services by an intermediary offinancial services located in a
multi services SEZ with Intemational Financial Services
Centre (IFSC) status to a customer located outside lndia for
intemational financial services in currencies other than
Indian rupees (INR).
Explanation.- For the purposes ofthis entry, the intermediaxy
offinancial services in IFSC is a person,-
(i) who is permitted or recognised as such by the
Government of India or any Regulator appointed for
regulation ofIFSC;or
(ii) who is treated as a person resident outside India under
the Foreign Exchange Management (International Financial
Services Centre) Regulations, 2015; or
(iii) who is registered under the Insurance Regulatory and
Development Authority of India (lntemational Financial
Service Centre) Guidelines, 2015 as IFSC lnsurance Of6ce;
or
(iv) who is permitted as such by Securities and Exchange
Board of India (SEBI)under the Sqcurities and Exchange
Board of India (lntemational Financial Services Centres)
Cuidelines, 20 t 5.

Nit Nil";



edqlre {qq-*, Qqi6 zs vq-{ff zor s 6t (s7l

C) against serial number 45,in the entry in column (3),-

i. in item (a), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

"(iii) the Central Covemment, State Govemment, Union territory, local authority,
Govemmental Autho ty or Govemment Entity;";

ii. in item (b), after sub-item (iii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

"(iv) the Central Government, State Govemment, Union territory, local authority,
Govemmental Authority or Govemment Entity;";

iii. in item (c), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
"(iii) the Central Government, State Govemment, Union territory, local authority,
Govemmental Authority or Govemment Entity.";

(k) after serial number 53 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be

inserted, namely : -

0) against serial number 54,in the entry in column (3), after item (g), the following item shall be inserted,
namely :-

"(h) services by way offumigation in a warehouse ofagricultural produce.";

(m) against serial number 60, in the entry in column (3), the words "the Ministry of Extemal Affairs," shall
be omitted;

(n) after serial number 65 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely : -

(o) against serial number 66, in the entry in column (3),-

i. after item (a), the.following item shall be inserted, namely:-

"(aa) by an educational institution by way of conduct of entrance examination against
consideration in the form ofentrance feef';

ii. in item (b),-

A. in sub-item (iv), the words "upto higher secondary" shall be omitted;

B. after sub-item (iv), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

"(v) supply ofonline educational journals or periodicals:";

C" in the proviso, for the word, brackets and letter "entry (b)", the words, brackets and
letters "sub-items (i), (ii) and (iii)ofitem (b)" shall be substituted;

D. after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

"Provided further that nothing contained in sub-item (v) of item (b) shall apply to an
institution providing services by way of,-

(D pre-school education and,education up to higher secondary school o1

equivalenu or

(iD education as a part ofan approved vocational education course.";

(l) Q) (3) (4) (5)

'53A Heading
9985

Services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural
produce.

Nil NiI";

(l) (2) (J' (4) (5)

*65A Heading
9991

Services by way of providing information under the Right to
Information Act, 2005 (22 ot2005).

Nil Nil";



6l (s8) edwrs rMTd, Giis rs vr+S zora

(p) against serial number 77, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words "five thousand", the
words "seven thousand five hundred" shall be substituted;

(q) against serial number 81, forthe entry in column (3), the following entry shall be substituted, namely: -
"Services by way ofright to admission to-

(a) circus, dance, or theatrical performance including drama or ballet;

(b) award function, concert, pageant, musical performance or any sporting event other than a
recognised sporting event;

(c) recognised sporting event;

(d) planetarium,

where the consideration for right to admission to the events or placesas referred to in items (a), (b), (c)
or (d) above is not more than Rs 500 per person.".

By order and in the name ofthe Governor ofChhattisgarh,
A. P. TRIPATHI, Special Secretary.

m-a+io' (,s-ro-g /zots/Ew/qtq(ro). - EftTnrd arfr 3fu tqr or 3rfuA-{fr,

2017 (2017 61 7) 6I effir 09 61 5q Eru (:) fi a-t-a u-{c? erfs-qt 6r q-sbr 6-ra gv,

{rs T*FE, q'fos-{ fi ffinfr fi 3flerR q{, 6fis4[6 cnsa * ErFrfufi 6{ F{sTr4 6I
rfrq{;Tr +i. rgzzorz-{ltq 6T (({) fiaiiE'qs, rc-43/zot7/Et6,/qiq (81) artu za qa
2orz, Et u.f,rr46 fi {rdtr{ (3rgnmur) nqtq zsz d dltq 29 qFr zotz 6t rorftId
lo-{ urqr e.r, f 3it{ $rn efr ffifud dlncrd 6-{fr t, qer ,-

rrd sfuqrdr d, -

(i ) €Rufr C, ffi-d {iqr 5 3itr ss$:d.ifud qfqBqi b qaqn, ffifualn-ff d@r
3it{ rs$:dEifud qfdftd ol 3ia,rerfud fu-qr drcrrfl, qer,-

ilqr {rqg{, Eaiih, zs sartl zora

3ifu(q-dT

+isqr o3zzora- rcq si{ (aT)

(r ) (2) (3 ) (4)

5rh' E-it€r[6 qrfr 3fu tqt or gfrF-+s,

2017 (2017 zFT z) *. 3iil/rd rifif-d
ffi Eqfu ol sr+a ffi 6t l6-{R,

tR E-i5-{ 6-fr S{.Fl:t, {rFq S{6R, Trq

lIFq tl{ qr Tsnfi-q qfu+rur & anr

fr ari qrff fur

ila srirr,
{IEZI TII'F'R,

iq rtGq Et{

Telrfiq
qtB-6{oT

EilTlrd ard 3lh tqr
6T 3rfrfr{fr, 2orz h
3iil4a dtrfa 6i$ efr

eqfu I


