T d9dRe www.govtpressmp.nic.in
T oft T are e 51 g g

HHIh 54] A1, AR, fAi® 25 SHad 2018—HM 5, WH 1939

qrivTsges & fTaur
T, Sy 9o, e

HHS ThH T 3-42-2017-1-9/=-(11) e, i 25 SHa 2018

LAWY Ate AR Far W HRORTA, 2017 & GRT 11 Y STYRT
(1) & &Fa Ued U 1 gANT RS §U, ToF WHR $H A § HIE 9 g€ 5
AT e A ravad ¢ R oRwg fr Rl & 3R ®), vaegry, s R &
YT FHEG TF T-3-42- 2017/1/@(53)%31351833-23!? 2017, & 3R mor o
Prafafe T #er & o -

Sera FigEen A, arof &, -

() ®H Fear 3 & AT FeHE (3) f gRRY F “wel uRed” gt F uaE
‘a1 I e el @ sia-enia R s, - _
(@) wma @egr 3 AR e @Al oREt & waa D@ & e Ak

107



108 Heqyey o9, T 25 SHad 2018

m | @ ) 4) | ()
“3F | rur | GRVE & InpedT 2438 & yiadd RRE TR | G | Wl
99 T AT FEAYE & H[edE 2437 F adta e
R o @ diY o Pl R @ wafte e
| PraTeRaTa F ATeEH { I WHR, ToY R
I FY ST 819 AT TR wieRor ar e
uifeTor a1 W) [ & & s el A
v Fauit B wgea ngfS Swst we f s
qgad MYfE &1 qEw 0 YR $ g5 F 25
afaera & 3@ 7 8 |

(TN) HH FEAT 16 F WAL, FieH (3) By F, “wr af” et F wwA w D
a8” ereel @ uferefa Rear s

(@) R wEa 19 IR s wEfa R § wag el mw de d@R
ufaf¥at &t sa.wnfa Rear sreen, g - _

™ | @ ) " T )

Yo% | N AR & Rya el Feera W | 5w ufafe o fafka =%

9965 FRIE BAF ¥ AR & I | 9 a1 30 RTFR, 2018

feua fFl e W agEa & & a1 WEY A el |

ST AT T gRag A & '

TEIA F § T areh dan

19w | oi§ Rad # R Rl oreew | ey | @ uRR F Ak 98
9965 FIRE RIT @ ARd & T i o 30 RaFR, 2018
YT et T W SeRE % & drg I e el |

ERT #e & uRaged @R &
AegH F & A arelr Far

(3) A HEAT 22 & AW, FH (3) F uRR A 7 @) F wIa, RERT A1
@ He.TUrg frar smeen, g -
“or) 0¥ Rl eufts e Rrenfil, sreurgwl iy seterfel . ofess o Rm s

a1 verE axar @ St fF Rawem @@ & e ik areufe w) oo g6 g f
e & Few F U YA ver war B




gy qoid, fedie 25 SFad 2018

108 (1)

() @3 @A 29 ¥ WA IR ey SOfE uRR & awaw BERRg o9 g
IR ufafeat o) sia.wenfora Rear steon, . -

¢h (2) (3) (4) (5)

(2]

“29% | oig Few TIPR B AWEHRE e Aot F g | T w;
9971 AT | FeIETd H FAANG H FaT Pu AW B3 ¥
o AR F e SIS aeh aqr vEe R oy
9991 T fow geafa & o Shas o dard |

(B) &H TEAT 36 & @Hal, IraA (3) & gl # 7z (1) F “vorm o’ wEt F
T WX A g el @ wRrenfoa e smoom;

(3 R dew 36 IR Y wElRg vfalrst & mwaw Refaf@e &7 @' iR
ufafeat & sig.vafUa frar streem, e -

) @) 3) (a) (5)

“36w | oinf HH HEAT 35 A 36 F AT dar At | e o i
9971 4T | & QoA AT F AIA F & SN arel Jag
Mg )
9991

(&) @A FHear 39 IR suw gdfa ufafeat & gevarg, Desfaf@a w5 dwar ik
ufateat o ufaeufa Rear oo, zom: -

M @) ) @) )

n

“39% | ofny Reelr @ dar ard PR e S o R | g G
9971 Wﬁm&#*mmmm
wrsaRiad afdds der @riveuad) Ve @,
F GO HRA F Ak Pua F uwe @
Jarsd ey Qanst & e oy Tue §
Brest foeely 35 o F & 9 Qg

wTediepeor -z owfafE & 3w ¥F v,
mdvwradr #F fche Qs F semew @
BT O @ L |
() O 9Ra WaR A 3w AT e o
FA=GAr @ & A B AT ofeRor 3 g
Affea 3wl & ¥ o o wdueead &
ffeasa & fov figra #1% Rfres & &
A AT &, a4

(i) 9 REl I vdum (iaRmdy Red
Far ¥egx) fafFmamEe, 2015 & a9 oRa &
g w1 B% Ry« aer Ry R, ar

(1) 57 7 st e fafeamsrs oF fa@rd
IRITROT (Iawsd e dar Feg) & e
&, 2015 & 3ienta ST ST I3REEr
& ®g F dfigpa &, a1

(i) T oo ufdsfa ve RRET @S,

2



108 (2)

Heqyey T, fadie 25 SHaEd 2018

G A s wRaE R @
(Hawrd, focdm aar aeg) Rwn-fagy, 2015
& oo 3w RAffea ela uaw & & |

(7) TR T 45 F AL, HieA (3) 6 wfafEy 7 -

7T (H), 30 7 (i) & ueamw, ReafR@a 35u 7 & a.cufa v s,
- |

“(ii1) Pex TR, ToU WER, WY T5T 47, TN GG, FERY T
T W B

#Z (@), 39 #g (i) & e, F=faf@d 3v #¢ & a.cufa fear s,
w:- .

“(iV) % TR, ToT TN, T T 8, TR GIRGOT, ERY ST
wm&frﬁm;"; ‘

e (W), 30 &g (i) & e, Pl su ag & sid.efa fear s,
“iill) deg TR, ToT TER, §9 ToT 89, TG WiRiEoT, e uriteor
a1 T R 1

m"mﬁmmmmﬁ#mammmm

(€)
ufatdat & . xnfa fear seen, g - )
n (2) ’ (3) 4) (5)

£«

53% | ofry P seurel & REEE A YA F AeIH ¥ & | |

»

9985 S arely e

(3) A TEAT 54 & THET, FaF (3) & vfA¥ & 72 ), F vga PR 7

& Ha-xafa frar e, - |
‘&) P scuel & Amersat #F @ & AgA § & 9 g Jar [

(3)

HH TET 60 & TG, B (3) H yRRY & w Ry Awe & dwen” @
foRfere fepar smea, g




Hegey Terad, T 25 Sl 2018

108 (3)

@) mA Hew 65 WX sEY Wil R ¥ cw BeriRd A dew R

Mm | @ (3) @ | )

»

‘65 | oM aer &1 HABR HRAFIH, 2005 (2005 B 22) F | T | WH
9991 | 3adid AT eI AR & AeH & & Y anel
/aw ‘

(o) o WEAT 66 & wHeT, i (3) Hr uffy -
I. o5 (@) & ueaa, Rl #g o ylawnfa fear sme, an-
“(@w) e deTNe dEUH T WA Yew & w9 F ofave & vaw # wow
ohaT B HRA T & T A e,

ii. #g @ #-
@) 39 (V) &, * Trafe v 98 u @ BRRe B s

@) 30 g (IV), & wud, Reafaf@a 31 & Ia.cua B amwm,

I -
“\V) TophEe SR A BfaiRwew B e ama oy & ameaw @
el e geam B

(1) Wegw #, oee, Fved AR R TR @) & wE | e, dved AR
3R “#e (@) F 3w Ag (1), (i) A i) " P virenfE R s

({) TegE & wEd Rl wegs ® yid-eaia R s, -
“‘qud 3R o 5 AT (@) F 3w Ag (W F RRT B o o W FeuEl W
o e gl S R, -

(i) e qf R 3#R souax Aarafie &R as a1 qeee &R a6
e ¥ FeH A; @ |

(1) e IegANed earaaTide AT UeTwd & Uh R ¥ ®7 A &
& AEIH ¥ O Jaw & @ @



108 (4) qeyRyl USHS, {25 SHad 2018

(@) w9 T 77 & GEG, Fow (3) A ORAR & # (1) F ‘UW R Y@ F
o w® ‘g wR o at’ e @ ufaeuia Rear S, gar-

@) FH e 81 ¥ GAN, TR () & TR F wE | DERd R @
ufaenfug fosar seem, gar:-

_“f?fmﬁ@aﬁqmraimaqmﬁﬁaﬁmm-

(@) THE, g 7 FAwer-doe et A @ 3 o afde @

(@) [ER TR, Woha @R AR iR ufRfr, Wi vl @ a
st N B Aegar weg HEr FARE ¥ e |
(31) HIAT TIed ST FARIE

() ARG,

Sl 3UgEd A (F), (@), (1) 7 (@) F 77 Wi GARE o TUE F G0 &
@GR F gfawa 500 ¥AT U aaf & 3RE 7 @

TEAYSY o TSI o AH § TUT STRIMIYR,
ITEUT AR, ITH(a.

Oure, T 25 SHadt 2018

HUH TH-T-3-42-2017-1-T9.—9RA % Hfaa™ & FI% 348 & QUG
(3) % ST B, 0 SRM™ ol SITUGT Al TH-T-3-42-2017-1-9F
(11), feaim 25 St 2018 &1 ST AR TAI & TSR H TIGGRI
EEANCRERIES I GHES

TG F TS o A § U1 AR,
3TRUT YR, IUdfde.




ARy e9d, faie 25 sHad 2018 108 (5)

No. F-A-3-42-2017-1-V (11) Bhopal, the 25th January 2018

In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 11 of the Madhya
Pradesh Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (19 of 2017), the State Government, on being
satisfied that it is necessary in the public interest so to do, on the recommendations of the
Council, hereby makes the following further amendments in this department's notification No.
FA-3-42/2017/1/V(53) dated the 30th June, 2017, namely:-

In the said notification, in the Table, -

(a) against serial number 3, in the entry in column (3), after the words “a Governmental
Authority” the words “ or a Government Entity” shall be inserted;

(b) after serial number 3 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and
entries shall be inserted, namely: -

a 1.@ G 4 ()
“3A | Chapter | Composite supply of goods and services in which |  Nil Nil”;
' 199 the value of supply of goods constitutes not more

than 25 per cent. of the value of the said composite
supply provided to the Central Government, State
Government or Union territory or local authority
or a Governmental authority or a Government
Entity by way of any activity in relation to any
function entrusted to a Panchayat under article
243G of the Constitution or in relation to any
function entrusted to a Municipality under article
243W of the Constitution.

(c) against serial number 16, in the cntry in column (3), for the words “one year”, the words
“three years” shall be substituted; '

(d) after serial number 19 and the'entries relating thereto, the following serial number and
entries shall be inserted, namely: -

(D 2) | 3) ). )
“I9A | Heading | Services by way of transportation | Nil | Nothing contained in this




108 (6)

weqyey o, Tl 25 SHel 2018

9965 of goods by an aircraft from serial number shall apply
customs station of clearance in after the 30 day of
India to a place outside India. September, 2018.
19B | Heading | Services by way of transportation | Nil Nothing contained in this
9965 of goods by a vessel from customs serial number shall apply
station of clearance in India to a after the 30" day of
place outside India. _ September, 2018.”;

(e) against serial ﬁumber 22, in the entry in column (3), after item (b), the following item
shall be inserted, namely: -
“(c) motor vehicle for transport of students, faculty and staff, to a person providing
services of transportation of students, faculty and staff to an educational institution
providing services by way of pre-school education and education upto higher secondary
school or equivalent.”;

(f) after serial number 29 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and
entries shall be inserted, namely: -
(1) (2) v ~ (3) 4) (5)
“29A | Heading [ Services of life insurance provided or agreed to be | Nil Nil”;
9971 or | provided by the Naval Group Insurance Fund to
Heading | the personnel of Coast Guard under the Group
9991 Insurance Schemes of the Central Government.

(g) against serial number 36, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “fifty
thousand”, the words “two lakhs” shall be substituted;

(h) after serial number 36 and the entries relating thereto, the followmg serial number and
entries shall be inserted, namely: -

(1) (2) 3) 4) (5)
“36A | Heading | Services by way of reinsurance of the insurance | Nil Nil”;
9971 or | schemes specified in serial number 35 or 36.
Heading
9991

(i) after serial number 39 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and
entries shall be inserted, namely: -

(1) () (3 4 5
“39A | Heading | Services by an intermediary of financial services | Nil Nil”;
9971 located in a multi services SEZ with International
Financial Services Centre (IFSC) status to a
customer located outside India for international

financial services in currencies other than Indian
rupees (INR).

Explanation.- For the purposes of this entry, the

P/




qegyeyl TS, e 25 sHad 2018 108 (7)

intermediary of financial services in IFSC is a
person,- :

(1) who is permitted or recognised as such by the
Government of India or any Regulator appointed
for regulation of IFSC; or

(ii) who is treated as a person resident outside
India under the Foreign Exchange Management
(International ~ Financial  Services  Centre)
Regulations, 2015: or

(iii) who is registered under the Insurance
Regulatory and Development Authority of India
(International Financial Service .  Centre)
Guidelines, 2015 as IFSC Insurance Office: or
(iv) who is permitted as such by Securities and
Exchange Board of India (SEBI) under the
Securities and Exchange Board of India
(International  Financial  Services Centres)
‘Guidelines, 2015.

() against serial number 45, in the entry in column (3),-
(1) initem (a), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(iil) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority,
Governmental Authority or Government Entity;”;

(i) in item (b), after sub-item (iii). the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(iv) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority,
Governmental Authority or Government Entity;”;

(iii) - initem (c), after sub-item (i1), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority,
Governmental Authority or Government Entity.”;

(k) after serial number 53 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and
entries shall be inserted, namely: -

(1) @ 3) 4) (5)
“53A | Heading | Services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of | Nil Nil™;
9985 agricultural produce.
(D)-against-serial-number-54—in-the entry i column (3), after item (g), the following item

all be inserted, namely:-
“(h) services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce.”;

=

S



108 (8) qeggey Aeas, o 25 Sad 2018

(m)against serial number 60, in the entry in column (3), the words “the Ministry of External
Affairs,” shall be omitted;

(n) after serial number 65 and the entries relatmg thereto, the following serial number and
entries shall be inserted, namely: -
(1) (2) (3) @ [ G
“65A | Heading | Services by way of providing information under the | Nil Nil”;
9991 Right to Information Act, 2005 (22 of 2005).

(o) against serial number 66, in the entry in column (3),-
(i) after item (a), the following item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(aa) by an educational institution by way of conduct of entrance examination
against consideration in the form of entrance fee;”;

(ii) initem (b),-
(A)in sub-item (iv), the words “upto higher secondary” shall be omitted;

(B) after sub-item (iv), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
" *“(v) supply of online educational journals or periodicals:”;

(C)in the proviso, for the word, brackets and letter “entry (b)”, the words, brackets
and letters “sub-items (i), (ii) and (iii) of item (b)"” shall be substituted;

(D)after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-
“Provided further that nothing contained in sub-item (v) of item (b) shall apply
to an institution providing services by way of,-
(i) pre-school education and education up to hlgher secondary school or
equivalent; or
(ii) education as a part of an dpproved vocational education course.”;

(p) against serial number 77, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “five
thousand”, the words “seven thousand five hundred” shall be substituted;

(q) against serial number 81, for the entry in coiumn (3), the following entry shall be
substituted, namely: -

“Services by way of right to admission to-

(a) circus. dance, or theatrical performance including drama or ballet;

(b) award function, concert, pageant, musical performance or any sporting event
other than a recognised sporting event;

{c) recognised sporting event;

(d) planetarium,

items (a), (b), (¢) or (d) above is not more than Rs 500 per person.”.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Madhya Pradesh,
ARUN PARMAR, Dy Secy.

iR, THR T HEOT qUl SE W, HeTgy GRI VI g HEOTer, Wi # qfia aun geifia—2018.



