ST 6. €1.UA.—33002/99 A WhRR REGISTERED No. D.L.-33002/99

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA

Delhi @azette

EXTRAORDINARY

TR | WeRTivTd
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

| 43] feoett, semfaar, wEd 15, 2018919 26, 1939 [Taaefe ¥ 446
No. 43] DELHI, THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 15, 2018/MAGHA 26, 1939 [N.C.T.D. No. 446

HA—IV
PART—IV

UL Tt T &4, feoelt W
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI

o (Irerea-1) f@simer
SIPSCEI
faeell, 13 HRadl, 2018
H. 1/2018-T=T FT
. BT, 03(83)/RA<(I1e1.-1)/2017-18/STTH-VI/74.—TE1T Trrem=t & faoeft F SUrsaare, faeet
AT UF AT T AA=aq, 2017 (2017 T 3) HT &7 10 T ITLTRT (1) F T T&ed oTiaadi w1 TTR Fd
TU ST ST U & 9RuE & FHRrer # e 97 Aot 9 & facd AN (Teea-1) it reg=ar 4.
8/2017- =7 %<, aT4r@ 30 S, 2017, = = w. 03/(14)@=/(T11.-1)/2017-18/5107-VI/357, ariiE 30
A, 2017, % q&q [aoet % TSI, AT, & 907 |V, § FH1q oham w3 o, § FAefeied siw geee
FTAT & TAT -
T ATERAT |, YT 9TE ¥ -
(F) SU-ATFT (1) T “Ueh TA9T” oTeat o TATT U “SATT T ereat bt qiaearioa fFhar srosm ;
(&) IT-ATHT (jii) F “SITad 7 AT AT QTaal T ¥ “Geqali it F AR SAYFT F Sad A1 Arem
TTAera” ereat I TqeaTad FohaT ST |

889 DG/2018 1)



2 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV]

2. 7 Stee=ET famrh 1 S=adt, 2018 & waret grf |

TP TSALTHT & faeeit F Iursaare
F AT T TAT I ATH U,

o Fo &g, 3w Atz -vI (=)

ME:- TG ARG AT 8/2017-757 F7, RAiw 30 S, 2017, F1 F. H. 03/(14)F/(T1.-1)/2017-
18/2TUH-VI/357, A 30 A, 2017 & q&q faectl & TSI, TETEI & -1V, § JHrera f&am
TAT AT Y THH Sfaw A Afeg=eT "Wemr 46/2017-0sy &, famw 27 qd|y, 2017, @
. 1. 03(54)/FB(FTTS.-1)/2017-18/FT0H-VI/760, THE 27 7347, 2017 F qgd (3o F oI,
ST o6 ART-IV, § wehtiora o smam o, & grer werres B @ g

FINANCE (REVENUE-1) DEPARTMENT

NOTIFICATION
Delhi, the 13th February, 2018
No. 1/2018-State Tax

No. F.3(83 )/Fin(Rev-1)/2017-18/DS-V1I/74.—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section
10 of the Delhi Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (Delhi Act 03 of 2017), the Lt. Governor of the National Capital
Territory of Delhi, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby makes the following further amendments in the
notification of the Government of Delhi in the Department of Finance (Revenue-1), No. 8/2017-State Tax, dated the 30th
June, 2017, published in the Gazette of Delhi, Extraordinary, Part IV, vide number F.3(14)/Fin (Rev-1)/2017-18/DS-
VI1/357, dated the 30th June, 2017, namely:-

In the said notification, in the opening paragraph, -
(a) inclause (i), for the words “one per cent.”, the words “half per cent.” shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (iii), for the words “half per cent. of the turnover”, the words ‘“half per cent. of the turnover of taxable
supplies of goods” shall be substituted.

2. This notification shall come into force with effect from the 1* day of J anuary, 2018.

By Order and in the Name of the Lt. Governor
of the National Capital Territory of Delhi,

A.K. SINGH, Dy. Secy. VI (Finance)

Note: The principal notification No.8/2017- State Tax, dated the 30" June, 2017, published in the Gazette of Delhi,
Extraordinary, Part IV, vide number F.3(14)/Fin(Rev-1)/2017-18/DS-V1/357, dated the 30" June, 2017 and last
amended by state notification No. 46/2017-State Tax, dated 27t November, 2017 published in the Gazette of
Delhi, Extraordinary, Part IV, vide number. F.3(54)/Fin(Rev-1)/2017-18/DS-V1/760, dated the, 27t November,
2017.



PART IV] DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY 3

RIPK R
33(_* , 13 CBIEPf , 2018

. 2/2018-TST T ()

. W 3(84)/fRA(T.-1)/2017-18/&ug-VI/75.—=o<tt a1er war 541 * stfarfa=w, 2017 (2017
T 3) dt awT 11 A IT 9T (1) F Ted Taed ARRIT FT TANT Fd g, TR TS o It *
IILTSAITA T a7 & € gid g0 o TAT F7A1 Safgd ¥ araeds g o afvus £ Rrerfen & aram uw,
TaEgT, feeeht avare, o farwmT (Trerea-1) #i sifdg=mT dear 12/2017-37 #7 (3%), faqm 30 99,
2017 & =, w1 03(15)/fa (T9%a-1)/2017-18/3174-VI/380, e 30 57, 2017 & dga faeetl &
TSI, AATLTIOT 3 ATT-IV, § TR AT 12T 9T, § e AR A7 MeAtertaa |eireas wadl 8, 97 -
Td STt H, At 7 -

(®) FH TEAT 3 F g FHAw (3) Fit At &, “Gwwrdy wriewrdy” orsat F qe=ATd A1 avwrt Fwra” oeat
T S eI AT ST, -

(@) F9 GEAT 3 37 A Aatad TAreay F vedra AmAterted w9 @ siw gfafteat v sia:warfug B
STTUSTT, J2T:-

(1) (2) (3) (4) (%)

“dg | ALATT 99 | WA F amum 243y k oasd fHRET dETIT KT AT | T =r;
TfaeT % S =ue 2439 * siqa AT W AR R S i
o T w1 T Aefda B BT F e 9 F

TCHTL, TS LR AT HF ST &7 AT TITHIT TTIERTOT AT
TLRTE ITFAHLOT AT GLHTE AT &7 &7 ST et 91 U
st 7 HAT i S A A 3F qgE A A
oA UHT ST o g 7 25 Tiqerd & aifers 7 ¥ |

(3M)  HEAT 16 % THeT, HieAw (3) T T2 |, “UF a0 9Teai o6 €9 92 A a9” ersai &1 Traearrod war
STTUIT,

() FF G 19 37 39T "atad GareAt F uearg Aetafea w0 S i gfateay wv siaetig
o SR, e -

(1) () 3) (4) (%)

“19% | ofiF 9965 | wEd ¥ FRuq frelt Feewq wfiadw wow | g7 | =9 wiat® # fAfga s ot a9

¥ 9Rd F arge oy T s e 30 e, 2018 % =g @[
AT * FI AT T Gae Fd el
TR F & ST ATeAr 4T T

199 | ofif 9965 | WA ¥ fRara et Feewm Feltovs o | g7 | 39 R & [Afew A ft e
¥ 9Rg F arge oy T v e 30 fRraware, 2018 % arg &

AT F G AT & Ieagd wed &

e & & S AT A T




4

DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY

PART IV]

()

()

AT 22 % TR, wiaw (3) f wfaf2 #, 9w (@) F gewma, Fwferta v & siaeurtug G s,

T -

“(m) ver el safxe v By, stearaent s wHETAT ® 9iEed & o /el argq o R ue

Srerfurer TeorTe BT fEr=rTtea, steaTasht Siiv FwE=TAt F qfvage v AT G Far gr o ok fHerer
& T freaT e wreAtie w7 AT aHEe T AY FUAT F AIEAH F AT HATU TG FLAT 857

FH GET 29 F HHY AT IAY Gogd QY F ge=ATa Fwlea w9 wedr 7 gt
Fa:eomfua Forar strosm, 9 -

()

(3)

‘29%

ofitt 9971 =7 ofi 9991

ElGIGEI

Fvg THTY 1 ATHIZH STHT TSI % STavid deedh &
FHATRAT HT T T T9ARE H 6 ATLAH & T&T 6T
S ATt a1 yee fru s F o agafy & w8 Sfaw

o

qLT”

(&) FH T=AT 36 F qH, FiH (3) T AATS H, A (1) H “TATH T ea1 o TITH UL “GT AT 9Te&1 I

staeafue 3T strosm,
(ST) ¥ "ear 36 Y 3a9 gateg yiateat F vesra Mwforfaa w0 gear siw afafe v sa et G
STTUNTT, T -
(1 (2) (3) “ |
“36% | ofitf 9971 7 off 9991 | FW HeAT 35 AT 36 H fAAfdTe AT ATl F T ftw1 | LT | o,
& ATAT T &F S aTedT Farg

(37) 9 TeAT 39 T AN AatAd A2 ai & we=rg, Meatarfea &9 gwear siw yf=afs=i @ vfawarfia
STTORTT, T -

(1)

(2)

3)

(4)

()

“39%

ofit 9971

Treft arg FaT arer =9 sufes S & Rua fEedi daei &
aremey SM&T  Teae wrEAltEe gfaas Hex
(AMEURTHAY) TEq Fr, F FT 9RG & AT feud AT
TTEF Al FAErser A Farett & forw 9 ' &
T et sreer 7T & 41 1 A

el - T gAY F IRew & foru, smEuwuaHr ®
el Framedt & grewey § aforma T ARE A g,

(i) o 9T a7 =9 M sqAfd a1 Jregar af g a1
et fafame wifgeeo 9 =9 [fea aqafa & & ar s
srEuRTaHt % fEfawe F oo e wE B © %

&9 ® qTeaar &t g, AT

o

a7,




PART IV] DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY 5

(i) o fFReht qer wegm e BT @ w)
faamastt, 2015 F si@ta wa F g F Frs HEEr
=27tk HTAT 47 21, AT

(i) s & e S s g B arfdsser
(AT A= #9T #e) F fRem-fAger, 2015 F siaeq
AR ST SferwTd F w9 H ushiFd g1, AT

(iii) & 9 wtagta v &ffws 9, @) F ade
wtasfa e e e (sarsdm, AT Ja&T ) fRer-
fa3er, 2015 & siaviq =& A srata wa= &t 3r |

()  FF HEAT 45 F gu, wiaw (3) f vt 7 -
i. T (F), IT 9= (i) F qeaTq, ReAtorted 39 7 # siaeriid B ST, T9m-
“(iii) g TTHRT, TTT ALHTL, T ST &0, TITAT TTTERT0T, LRI TTTEFRT0r A7 HeahTy e,
ii. 9% (@), 3T AT (i) F Te=ATE, Mt 37 4 T Sq:EATiad FRAT Srus, F9m-
“(iv) ¥ TTRIT, TS GRTE, 9 ST G, T TR0, TRty TIIEHaor a1 FqThT
IREIRAS
iii. TE (M), 3T AZ (ii) F weAATq, MR 3T g v Sq wATa AT S, To9w-
“(ill) v TLHRTY, TS TR, 99 TS 9, T ISR, Aeht<r TR AT FhTT
IREIR NN
() FH TEAT 53 AT IHH FAT8d TATSAT F TeATT [MEAToed w7 e 3T TatS &l da-eq7iua har
STTUNTT, FIT: -

(1) () (3) (4) ()

“53% | ofitf 9985 | FIT ITITET & AATZTSHI H [ o ATEAT F & ST ATAT HaAT0 T T,

(8) FH TEAT 54 F wHe, Fiaw (3) &ty # 7% (®), F geura Fwfotua #g 7 saenfia B
STTUSTT, 79T~
“(ST) FTY ITUTRT F FALETSHT | AT F ATLAH T & ST ATAT FAT0 |7

(8) ¥ T=AT 60 F THeA, HiaAw (3) A w2 7 erex “FAwer aver F worerg” wr fAef{e frar sromm)

(&) FY TEAT 65 3i¥ 3T« Fafdd =BT F ge=rq FAeaferfra sww w@wear =i af=afe= v s et B
STTUNTT, F2T: -

(1) (@) (3) (4) ()

“65% | o1 9991 | g=T T srferepT srfarfeas, 2005 (2005 FT 22) * i LT |
STAFTET 219 F2F F HIETH H &7 AT ared] Jara




6 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV]

(1)  FH HEAT 66 F THA, Hiw (3) F v 7 -
i, T% (F) F geArd, Meferiea 7 & giaeenfug Brar s, aom-
“(Fer) ToreT SreafoTesn HeaT ETT WA Q06 o ®T H WA % UaST § AT TEEAT HT SAISd FHeh
2 ST ATAT FAT;”
i. 9% (@) .-
(®) IT-TE (iv) T, “ qreaiis Fa< aF” oreal & [Afea Brar s,
(@) 37 9% (iv), F TeaTa, Metorfea o g 1 szt B s, a90m:-
“(v) TSRS ST AT TR & o AT i & Area® & T Qrerfors S w7
(3) TTRIF |, 9157, FTeF AT AT ‘AT (@)’ F T I 9767, FCSH AL AL “HE (F) % 3T
7z (i), (i) S (iii) 7 =7 vtaeariog BT S,
() g * qeATd AEatorted wwegs v sraeariea e S, -
“Ferd ST AT 7o 72 (@) F 37 °E (v) § [igq Fr @ a7a UH €41 9% 90 q5l gRir i &6, -
(i) e g foreT s S==ae areata Tq¥ aF AT AHFET T aF (90T % qreqq q; AT
(i) T srqeieT sameatias forar gt % U fRE % w9 § forem % AveAw & sty
AT T 7 B
(@) 9 G=AT 77 F G0, FiAH (3) FT IATS H, 7 (1) § “I79 AT 9T5&1 o £ T¢I AL T4 A1
great T Tfawetaa T srosm, Tom:-
(¥) F9 e 81 F 90, Few (3) f g=E F v w Fefofeg af=fe s ey G s,
AT
- H Ta9T % ATIRIE F & H &1 ST ATeAT JaT0 —
() T, oI AT Frue-v=a s ares 71 9o off anfae g;

(@) [EERTE THTAE, S9a T6rE o7 afore sfaarar, =¥ wee™ a1 s st s & Jredar

T ST FHTE | T3 3T,
(3T) AT 9T HIET THHE,
() ATTHE;
gt SUFd HE (F), (@), (1) AT (F) § TAT T THIE T T H T390 F AT F7 Tiawer
500 ¥9T Fia =9f<h & 1fere 7 2.
2. 7g wferg=mar 25 Sast, 2018 | yqa g |
TET YT & faeet % 3uersaarer
= LT & TAT Ik ATH T,

v. ¥ g, syafRa- VI ()

qe . v wfegEET @ 12/2017-357 ¥ (3€), faAiw 30 §9, 2017 & &, W 03(15)/faw

(TTST%a-1)/2017-18/3T0H-VI/380, famih 30 57, 2017  dgd et  TSTT, SETLTI, & 9H-1V,

H eTiera T T o S TaH sifam a1 ateEeT "@ear 47/2017-0s7 7 (37) i+ 28 79w,

2017 & =, w1, 03(65)/fA=(Teea-1)/2017-18/E1=a-V1/773, faAT® 28 Fawaw, 2017 F dgd
Taeelt 3 TSI, STETETeOr, F ARV, § STRTiera foam 3w o, & g geres g



PART IV]

DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY

NOTIFICATION

Delhi, the 13th February, 2018

No. 2/2018-State Tax (Rate)

No.F3(84)/Fin (Rev-1)/2017-18/DS-V1/75.—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section
11 of the Delhi Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (Delhi Act 03 of 2017),
Territory of Delhi, on being satisfied that it is necessary in the public interest so to do, on the recommendations of the

the Lt. Governor of National Capital

Council, hereby makes the following further amendments in the notification of the Government of Delhi, in the Department of Finance
(Revenue-1), No.12/2017-State Tax (Rate), dated the 30" June, 2017, published in the Gazette of Delhi, Extraordinary, Part IV, vide
number No.F3(15)/Fin/(Rev-1)/2017-18/DS-VI/380, dated the 30™ June, 2017, namely:-
In the said notification, in the Table, -

(a) against serial number 3, in the entry in column (3), after the words “a Governmental Authority” the words “or a

Government Entity” shall be inserted,;
(b) after serial number 3 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be inserted,

namely: -
&) 2 3 “ ®)
“3A Chapter 99 | Composite supply of goods and services in which the value of Nil Nil”;

supply of goods constitutes not more than 25 per cent. of the value
of the said composite supply provided to the Central Government,
State Government or Union territory or local authority or a
Governmental authority or a Government Entity by way of any
activity in relation to any function entrusted to a Panchayat under
article 243G of the Constitution or in relation to any function
entrusted to a Municipality under article 243W of the Constitution.

(c) against serial number 16, in the entry in column (3), for the words “one year”, the words “three years” shall be
substituted;
(d) after serial number 19 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be inserted,

namely: -
Q) 2 3 “ &)
“19A Heading 9965 | Services by way of transportation of goods by | Nil Nothing contained in this serial

an aircraft from customs station of clearance number shall apply after the
in India to a place outside India. 30thday of September, 2018.

19B Heading 9965 | Services by way of transportation of goods by | Nil Nothing contained in this serial
a vessel from customs station of clearance in numbershall apply after the
India to a place outside India. 30"day of September, 2018.”;

(e) against serial number 22, in the entry in column (3), after item (b), the following item shall be inserted, namely: -
“(c) motor vehicle for transport of students, faculty and staff, to a person providing services of transportation of
students, faculty and staff to an educational institution providing services by way of pre-school education and
education upto higher secondary school or equivalent.”;

(f) after serial number 29 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be inserted,

namely: -

(1)

)

3)

“

)

“29A

Heading 9971 or Heading 9991

Government.

Services of life insurance provided or agreed to be provided | Nil
by the Naval Group Insurance Fund to the personnel of Coast
Guard under the Group Insurance Schemes of the Central

Nil”;




DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY

PART IV]

(g) against serial number 36, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “fifty thousand”, the words “two
lakhs” shall be substituted;

(h) after serial number 36 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be inserted,
namely: -

(1)

2)

3)

“

)

“36A | Heading 9971 or Heading 9991

specified in serial number 35 or 36.

Services by way of reinsurance of the insurance schemes | Nil

Nil”;

(i) after serial number 39 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be inserted,

namely: -
M (@) 3 ) (5)
“39A | Heading Services by an intermediary of financial services located in a | Nil Nil”;
9971 multi services SEZ with International Financial Services

Centre (IFSC) status to a customer located outside India for
international financial services in currencies other than
Indian rupees (INR).

Explanation.- For the purposes of this entry, the intermediary
of financial services in IFSC is a person,-

(i) who is permitted or recognised as such by the
Government of India or any Regulator appointed for
regulation of IFSC;or

(ii) who is treated as a person resident outside India under
the Foreign Exchange Management (International Financial
Services Centre) Regulations, 2015; or

(iii) who is registered under the Insurance Regulatory and
Development Authority of India (International Financial
Service Centre) Guidelines, 2015 as IFSC Insurance Office;
or

(iv) who is permitted as such by Securities and Exchange
Board of India (SEBI)under the Securities and Exchange
Board of India (International Financial Services Centres)
Guidelines, 2015.

(j) against serial number 45, in the entry in column (3),-

i.

ii.

iii.

in item (a), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or

Government Entity;”;

in item (b), after sub-item (iii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(@v) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or

Government Entity;”;

in item (c), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or

Government Entity.”;




PART IV]

DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY

9

(k) after serial number 53 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be inserted,

namely: -
) @) 3 “ (6]
“53A Heading 9985 | Services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce. Nil Nil”;

(1) against serial number 54, in the entry in column (3), after item (g), the following item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(h) services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce.”;

(m) against serial number 60, in the entry in column (3), the words “the Ministry of External Affairs,” shall be omitted;

(n) after serial number 65 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be inserted,

namely: -
1) 2 (3) “) )
“65A Heading 9991 | Services by way of providing information under the Right to | Nil Nil”;
Information Act, 2005 (22 of 2005).

(o) against serial number 66, in the entry in column (3),-

ii.

1.

after item (a), the following item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(aa) by an educational institution by way of conduct of entrance examination against consideration in the
form of entrance fee;”;

in item (b),-

A. in sub-item (iv), the words “upto higher secondary” shall be omitted;

B. after sub-item (iv), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(v) supply of online educational journals or periodicals:”;

C. in the proviso, for the word, brackets and letter “entry (b)”, the words, brackets and letters “sub-items (i),
(i1) and (iii)of item (b)” shall be substituted;

D. after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-
“Provided further that nothing contained in sub-item (v) of item (b) shall apply to an institution providing
services by way of,-

(i) pre-school education and education up to higher secondary school or equivalent; or
(i) education as a part of an approved vocational education course.”;

(p) against serial number 77, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “five thousand”, the words “seven
thousand five hundred” shall be substituted;

(q) against serial number 81, for the entry in column (3), the following entry shall be substituted, namely: -

“Services by way of right to admission to-

(a) circus, dance, or theatrical performance including drama or ballet;

(b) award function, concert, pageant, musical performance or any sporting event other than a recognised

sporting event;

(c) recognised sporting event;

(d) planetarium,

where the consideration for right to admission to the events or places as referred to in items (a), (b), (c) or (d)

above is not more than Rs. 500 per person.”.

2. This notification shall come into force with effect from the 25™ day of January, 2018.

By Order and in the Name of the Lt. Governor
of National Capital Territory of Delhi,

A K. SINGH, Dy. Secy.-VI (Finance)




10 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV]

Note: The principal notification was published in the Gazette of Delhi, Extraordinary, vide notification No. 12/2017-
State Tax (Rate), dated the 30™June, 2017, vide number F. 3(15)/Fin(Rev-1)/2017-18/DS-VI/380, dated the
30"June, 2017 and was last amended by notification No. 47/2017-State Tax (Rate), dated the 28" November,
2017 vide number F. 3(65)/Fin(Rev-1)/2017-18/DS-V1/773, dated the 28" November, 2017.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. ALO K Digitally signed
by ALOK KUMAR

Date: 2018.02.28
KU MAR 11:34:20 +05'30'



		2018-02-28T11:34:20+0530
	ALOK KUMAR




